
Bids Issued: Bids Recd:

1st Ad: 4/9/2009 2nd Ad: 4/16/2009

Qty Unit Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
1 50 Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $635.00 $31,750.00 $448.00 $22,400.00 No Bid No Bid
2 325 Dry Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $355.00 $115,375.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 4000 Gal $3.54 $14,140.00 $4.13 $16,520.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 10000 Lb $2.95 $29,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5 15000 Lb No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.64 $9,600.00 No Bid No Bid
6 154 Dry Ton $625.00 $96,250.00 No Bid No Bid $538.00 $82,852.00 $676.00 $104,104.00 No Bid No Bid
7 500 Lb $1.35 $675.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8 31275 Dry Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.55 $17,201.25

Qty Unit Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
9 Liquid Chlorine Bleach 4200 Gal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.79 $3,318.00 No Bid No Bid

10 12000 Dry Lb No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.20 $14,400.00
11 Calcium Hypochlorite  9000 Lb $1.35 $12,150.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$152,715.00 $16,520.00 $229,977.00 $139,422.00 $31,601.25

No Exceptions

Item # 9 - Liquid Chlorine 
Bleach - Price based on 

4000 gl order. No Exceptions

2:00PM

15 9

Fort Bend Services, Inc.
13303 Redfish Lane
Stafford, TX 77477

BID GRAND TOTAL……………………………………..
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NOTES……………………………………………………….

Polymer

No Exceptions to items.      
Exceptions to way contract is to 
be written.

Hydrofluosillic Acid

Polymer

Liquid Alum/Copper Sulfate Blend

DPC Industries
601 W. Industrial Blvd.
Cleburne, TX 76033

Pencco, Inc.
P.O. Box 600

Name of Bidder…………………………………….
Address…………………………………………….
City,State,Zip………………………………………

2627 Weir St.

318-2009
Water/Wastewater 
Chemicals

Water/Wastewater  
Harcross Chemicals

Dallas, TX 75212

Tabulation of Bids
City of Grapevine Bid/Project Name:

Requesting Dept:

Potassium Permanganate

Bid Opening Date: 4/24/2009

WATER TREATMENT PLANT CHEMICALS:

Altivia Corporation
1100 Louisiana St.
Houston, TX 77002

Bid/Project Number:

San Felipe, TX 77473

In event of plant shutdown, 
Vendor not responsible for cost 
incurred or lead time to obtain 
product elsewhere

Item

Calcium Hypochlorite (HTH)

WASTEWATER TREATMENT PLANT CHEMICALS
Item

Anhydrous Ammonia
Sodium Hydroxide Solution

Liquid Chlorine



Bid/Project Number:

Bid/Project Name: Bids Issued: Bids Recd:

1st Ad: 4/9/2009 2nd Ad: 4/16/2009

Qty Unit Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
1 50 Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 325 Dry Ton $340.00 $110,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 4000 Gal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 10000 Lb No Bid No Bid $4.35 $43,500.00 $3.04 $30,350.00 No Bid No Bid
5 15000 Lb No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 154 Dry Ton No Bid No Bid $660.00 $101,640.00 $500.00 $77,000.00 No Bid No Bid
7 500 Lb $1.720 $860.00 $1.80 $900.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8 31275 Dry Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Qty Unit Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount
9 Liquid Chlorine Bleach 4200 Gal $1.800 $7,560.00 $1.35 $5,670.00 $1.06 $4,452.00 No Bid No Bid

10 Polymer 12,000 Dry Lb No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11 Calcium Hypochlorite  9000 Lb $1.720 $15,480.00 $1.80 $16,200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

 BID GRAND TOTAL…………………………………….. $134,400.00 $167,910.00 $111,802.00 $0.00

No Exceptions No Exceptions

Page 2
Recreonics

704 E. Wintergreen St

15 9

4200 Schmitt Ave
Univar
10889 Bekay St

Bid Opening Date: 4/24/2009 2:00PM

Item #2 - Liquid Alum - 
Testing Method Different, 

use of HydrometersNOTES……………………………………………………….

Polymer

WATER TREATMENT PLANT CHEMICALS:
Item

WASTEWATER TREATMENT PLANT CHEMICALS
Item

Liquid Alum/Copper Sulfate Blend 2608
Hydrofluosillic Acid
Potassium Permanganate
Anhydrous Ammonia
Sodium Hydroxide Solution
Calcium Hypochlorite (HTH)

No Exceptions.                            
No References.

Louisville, KY 40213

318-2009

Liquid Chlorine

Dallas, Texas 75238Kirbyville, Texas 75956City,State,Zip………………………………………

Tabulation of Bids
City of Grapevine

567 County Road 3065
Name of Bidder…………………………………….
Address…………………………………………….

Water/Wastewater  
Simply Aquatics
Requesting Dept:

Lancaster, TX 75134

Water/Wastewater 
Chemicals

Brenntag Southwest



Bid/Project Number: Bid Opening Date: 3/18/2005

Bid/Project Name: Water/Wastewater ChemicalsBids Issued: 15 Bids Recd: 9

1st Ad: 3/3/2005 2nd Ad: 3/10/2005

Page 3

Items:   6

Items:  3, 4, 7, 11
Items:   1, 5, 9
Items:   8, 10
Items    2

Tabulation of Bids
City of Grapevine

Gulbrandsen Technologies Inc

Requesting Dept: Water/Wastewater  

Univar

No Bid Vendors:
Recreonics

DPC Industries
Fort Bend Services
AltiviaAtlantic Coast Polymers

D.C.C.

Ultimate Washer

Accurate Lab Supply
Non Responsive Vendors:

Harcoss ChemicalsJLM Industries, Inc

221-2005

SUMMARY OF BIDS

Low Bid Vendors
BID SUMMARY


	Sheet1

